
BOLLNÄS TUESDAY, AUGUST 3

RACE 1 Volt 2140

Only ranking.

RANK
A: 10

B: 9-11-7-5-8-2-3-4

C: 6-1

Top 4: 10-9-11-7

Quinella:
Horses: 7, 9, 11
U-Horses: 10
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 10
2: 7, 9, 11
3: 7, 9, 11
Total: 6 x 2 = 12

RACE 2 Volt 2140

Only ranking.

RANK
A: 7

B: 3-9-5

C: 4-6-8-1-2

Top 4: 7-3-9-5

Quinella:
Horses: 3, 5, 9
U-Horses: 7
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 7
2: 3, 5, 9
3: 3, 5, 9
Total: 6 x 2 = 12



BOLLNÄS TUESDAY, AUGUST 3

RACE 3 Volt 2140

Only ranking.

RANK
A: 5

B: 7-1

C: 3-2-6-4

Top 4: 5-7-1-3

Quinella:
Horses: 1, 7
U-Horses: 5
Total: 2 x 10 = 20

Trifecta:
1: 5
2: 1, 7
3: 1, 7
Total: 2 x 2 = 4

RACE 4, V64-1 Auto 2140

3 Hemisphere is up and down but has good capacity and
matches these opponents easily. Was back in good shape again
in the last race. Good chance. 6 No Doubt makes his comeback
again after a pause. Was not at his best in his comeback in
March but has good skills. Is certainly well prepared now. 7
Kissinger Boko is in great shape and has been matched in the
V75. Is more strong than fast and can do it tough. Has to be
followed. 1 Chestnut Bojje galloped in the last race and does not
always trot well. Had put in several strong efforts before that.

RANK
A: 3-6

B: 7-1-2-5-4

C:

Top 4: 3-6-7-1

Quinella:
Horses: 1, 6, 7
U-Horses: 3
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 3
2: 1, 6, 7
3: 1, 6, 7
Total: 6 x 2 = 12



BOLLNÄS TUESDAY, AUGUST 3

RACE 5, V64-2 Auto 1640

10 Global Bitcoin has not won for a long while but needs to
defend a victory here and meets easier opponents. Should have
a good chance with the right journey. Can finish strongly. 4
Solöns Allica has one run under her belt now and should be
improved a lot. Had a long pause before that and met tough
opponents last season. Good chance in the lead. 3 Twilight
Angel comes from a good victory and is in fine form. Normally
she faces too good horses here but form beats class. Has to be
followed. 9 Ivrietta I.H. got a trip from outside the leader in the
last race and was very brave. With the right journey the horse
will be in the mix again.

RANK
A: 10

B: 4-3-9

C: 6-1-2-5-7-8-11

Top 4: 10-4-3-9

Quinella:
Horses: 3, 4, 9
U-Horses: 10
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 10
2: 3, 4, 9
3: 3, 4, 9
Total: 6 x 2 = 12

RACE 6, V64-3 Auto 2140

2 Miss Imperatrice has done everything right and scored two
straight wins. Is promising and Timo Nurmos is pleased with
here. Has a good chance to reach the front again. Banker. 6
Kashmir River comes also from two straight wins and is in great
shape. Found the lead in the last race and scored a good victory.
3 Dandruff finished strongly in the last race and is in good form.
Won easily in the lead three starts back. 10 West Wind galloped
in the last race but came back well showing 16/2000. Possible
but needs some racing luck.

RANK
A: 2

B: 6-3-10-8-9-1

C: 4-7-5

Top 4: 2-6-3-10

Quinella:
Horses: 3, 6, 10
U-Horses: 2
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 2
2: 3, 6, 10
3: 1, 3, 6, 8, 9, 10
Total: 15 x 2 = 30



BOLLNÄS TUESDAY, AUGUST 3

RACE 7, V64-4 Volt 2640

9 Final Whistle is in good shape and has scored two straight
wins. Has put in good efforts and with the right trip he should
be considered. Can do it tough. 1 Bowling Orlando is interesting
in the lead. Has a good chance to reach the front here and will be
hard to beat then. Got locked in with energy left. 10 Rio Alta
Wine has met tough opponents lately. Is normally strong but
has not convinced lately. Easier horses this time. 5 John Joep
has done well lately but faces tougher opponents here. Is quite
fast for this class though.

RANK
A: 9

B: 1-10-5-7

C: 6-2-11-3-8-4

Top 4: 9-1-10-5

Quinella:
Horses: 1, 10
U-Horses: 9
Total: 2 x 10 = 20

Trifecta:
1: 9
2: 1, 10
3: 1, 5, 7, 10
Total: 6 x 2 = 12

RACE 8, V64-5 Auto 1640

3 Syoss likes this distance and faces perfect conditions to lead
this from start to finish. Will reach the front and is in good
shape. 5 Deede Star is both strong and fast and has met tough
opponents. Was really nice two starts back but not at his best in
the last race. Contender. 9 Twinkle Face is in good form but
needs the right journey to finish very fast over the home
stretch. Could defeat all opponents here. 7 Findus M. finished
strongly in the last race. Is in good form and can do it tough. Will
probably get an offensive journey here.

RANK
A: 3-5

B: 9-7

C: 10-11-8-1-6-4-2

Top 4: 3-5-9-7

Quinella:
Horses: 3, 5
Total: 1 x 10 = 10

Trifecta:
1: 3, 5
2: 3, 5
3: 7, 9
Total: 4 x 2 = 8



BOLLNÄS TUESDAY, AUGUST 3

RACE 9, V64-6 Auto 2140

5 Björlifanner has met V75-opponents on several occasions
lately. Is in good form and faces easier horses here. Early
contender regardless the journey. 12 Månremus has put in
several nice performances lately and was outstanding two
starts back. Failed in the last race but is fast for this class. 2
Valle Hugo was outstanding in the last race in Norway and is in
good shape. Is ideally drawn and should not be overlooked. 8
Norrbo Odin finished strongly in the last race and can do it
tough. Needs quick pace to be in the mix here.

RANK
A: 5

B: 12-2-8-1-4-9-3

C: 11-6-10-7

Top 4: 5-12-2-8

Quinella:
Horses: 2, 8, 12
U-Horses: 5
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 5
2: 2, 8, 12
3: 1, 2, 3, 4, 8, 9, 12
Total: 18 x 2 = 36

RACE 10 Volt 2140

Only ranking.

RANK
A: 6-8-5

B: 12-13-14-7-1-3-2

C: 9-10-4-11

Top 4: 6-8-5-12

Quinella:
Horses: 5, 6, 8
Total: 3 x 10 = 30

Trifecta:
1: 6
2: 5, 8
3: 5, 8, 12, 13, 14
Total: 8 x 2 = 16


	RACE 1
	RANK
	RACE 2
	RANK
	RACE 3
	RANK
	RACE 4, V64-1
	RANK
	RACE 5, V64-2
	RANK
	RACE 6, V64-3
	RANK
	RACE 7, V64-4
	RANK
	RACE 8, V64-5
	RANK
	RACE 9, V64-6
	RANK
	RACE 10
	RANK

